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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 Standard Small Motor Up to 10 to 250 HP and icludes rewinding,

 reconditioning, machine-work, and tear-down, inspect and

 repair

  UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 207.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. Single-Phase, up to 10 HP Recondition TOTAL 207.50    

UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 481.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Single-Phase, up to 10 HP Rewind TOTAL 481.00    

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 10 HP Frame 215JM RPM 3505 ENCL TE Voltage PRICE 337.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

3. 208/230/460 Recondtion TOTAL 337.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 10 HP Frame 215TP RPM 1725 ENCL TE Voltage PRICE 337.00 NO BID 1,000.00 NO BID

4. 1725 ENCL TE Voltage 230/460  Recondition TOTAL 337.00  1,000.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 10 HP Frame 215JM RPM 3505 ENCL TE Voltage PRICE 611.00 NO BID 3,400.00 NO BID

5. 208/230/460 Rewind TOTAL 611.00  3,400.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 10 HP Frame 215TP RPM 1725 ENCL TE Voltage PRICE 555.00 NO BID 3,400.00 NO BID

6. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 555.00  3,400.00  

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 555.00 NO BID 3,400.00 NO BID

7. Three-Phase, 10 HP Frame 213 JPZ Rewind TOTAL 555.00  3,400.00  

 UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 365.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

8. Three-Phase, 15 HP Frame 215TYZ Recondition TOTAL 365.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 15 HP Frame 254JM RPM 3450 ENCL TE Voltage PRICE 744.00 NO BID 3,400.00 NO BID

9. 208/230/460 Rewind TOTAL 744.00  3,400.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 20 HP Frame 256JM RPM 3525 ENCL TE Voltage PRICE 365.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

10. 208/230/460 Recondtion TOTAL 365.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 20 HP Frame 256JM RPM 3525 ENCL TE Voltage PRICE 854.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

11. 208/230/460 Rewind TOTAL 854.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 20 HP Frame 256JM RPM 3525 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 854.00 NO BID 3,400.00 NO BID

12. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 854.00  3,400.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 25 HP Frame 256JM RPM 3500 ENCL OPSB Voltage PRICE 338.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

13. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 338.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 25 HP Frame 256JM RPM 3500 ENCL OPSB Voltage PRICE 810.00 NO BID 3,400.00 NO BID

14. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 810.00  3,400.00  

1 ea. UNIT

 Three-Phase, 30 HP Frame 7011Z RPM 1790 ENCL Voltage PRICE 2,120.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

15. 4160 Recondition TOTAL 2,120.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 30 HP Frame 7011Z RPM 1790 ENCL Voltage PRICE 7,390.00 NO BID 3,400.00 NO BID

16. 4160 TOTAL 7,390.00  3,400.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 40 HP Frame 324TP RPM 1775 ENCL DP Voltage 460 PRICE 880.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

17.  Recondition TOTAL 880.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 40 HP Frame 324TP RPM 1775 ENCL DP Voltage 460 PRICE 1,603.00 NO BID 3,600.00 NO BID

18 Rewind TOTAL 1,603.00  3,600.00  
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 40 HP Frame 324TS RPM 1780 ENCL TE Voltage 230/460 PRICE 1,231.00 NO BID 3,600.00 NO BID

19. Rewind TOTAL 1,231.00  3,600.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 40 HP Frame 324T RPM 3530 ENCL DP Voltage 230/460 PRICE 1,127.00 NO BID 3,600.00 NO BID

20. Rewind TOTAL 1,127.00  3,600.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 50 HP Frame 326TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 880.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

21. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 880.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 50 HP Frame 364TP RPM 1780 ENCL WP1 Voltage 230/460 PRICE 1,059.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

22. Recondition TOTAL 1,059.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 50 HP Frame 326TP RPM 1765 ENCL WP1 Voltage 230/460 PRICE 880.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

23.  WP1 Recondition TOTAL 880.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 50 HP Frame 326TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 PRICE 1,768.00 NO BID 3,800.00 NO BID

24. Voltage 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 1,768.00  3,800.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 50 HP Frame 364TP RPM 1780 ENCL WP1 PRICE 1,768.00 NO BID 3,800.00 NO BID

25. Voltage 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 1,768.00  3,800.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 50 HP Frame 326TP RPM 1765 ENCL WP1  PRICE 1,768.00 NO BID 3,800.00 NO BID

26. Voltage 230/460 WP1 Rewind TOTAL 1,768.00  3,800.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 50 HP Frame 324JP RPM 3525  ENCL DP Voltage 230/460 PRICE 1,497.00 NO BID 3,800.00 NO BID

27. Rewind TOTAL 1,497.00  3,800.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 60 HP Frame B364TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 1,059.00 NO BID 1,200.00 NO BID

28. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,059.00  1,200.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 60 HP Frame B364TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage  PRICE 2,036.00 NO BID 4,000.00 NO BID

29. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 2,036.00  4,000.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 60 HP Frame H445TP-28 RPM  ENCL  Voltage 230/460 PRICE 2,462.00 NO BID 400.00 NO BID

30. Rewind TOTAL 2,462.00  400.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage 230/460 PRICE 1,059.00 NO BID 1,463.00 NO BID

31. Recondition TOTAL 1,059.00  1,463.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365TCZ RPM 3550 ENCL TEFC PRICE 1,059.00 NO BID 1,463.00 NO BID

32. Voltage 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,059.00  1,463.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage 230/460 PRICE 2,376.00 NO BID 4,236.00 NO BID

33. Rewind TOTAL 2,376.00  4,236.00  

1 ea. UNIT  

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365TCZ RPM 3550 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 2,411.00 NO BID 4,758.00 NO BID

34. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 2,411.00  4,758.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365T RPM 1780 ENCL DP Voltage 230/460 PRICE 2,194.00 NO BID 4,236.00 NO BID

35. Rewind TOTAL 2,194.00  4,236.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage 230/460 PRICE 2,376.00 NO BID 4,236.00 NO BID

36. Rewind TOTAL 2,376.00  4,236.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365TP RPM 1765 ENCL DP Voltage PRICE 2,376.00 NO BID 4,236.00 NO BID

37. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 2,376.00  4,236.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365TS RPM 1775 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 2,194.00 NO BID 4,236.00 NO BID

38. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 2,194.00  4,236.00  
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
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1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 75 HP Frame 365T RPM 1775 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 2,194.00 NO BID 4,236.00 NO BID

39. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 2,194.00  4,236.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 100 HP Frame 444VP RPM 1190 ENCL TE Voltage 230/460 PRICE 1,692.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

40. Recondition TOTAL 1,692.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 100 HP Frame 404TP RPM 1780 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 1,413.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

41. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,413.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 100 HP Frame 404TP RPM 1780 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 1,432.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

42. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,432.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 100 HP Frame 444VP RPM 1190 ENCL TE Voltage 230/460 PRICE 4,267.00 NO BID 6,558.00 NO BID

43. Rewind TOTAL 4,267.00  6,558.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 100 HP Frame 404TP RPM 1780 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 3,414.00 NO BID 5,288.00 NO BID

44. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 3,414.00  5,288.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 100 HP Frame 404TP RPM 1780 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 3,414.00 NO BID 5,288.00 NO BID

45. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 3,414.00  5,288.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 125 HP Frame 405TP20 RPM 1770 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 1,432.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

46. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,432.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 125 HP Frame 405TP RPM 1780 ENCL DP Voltage 230/460 PRICE 1,432.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

47. Recondition TOTAL 1,432.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 125 HP Frame 404TC RPM 3565 ENCL ODP Voltage PRICE 1,212.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

48. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,212.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 125 HP Frame 404TCZ RPM 3565 ENCL ODP Voltage PRICE 1,212.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

49. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,212.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 125 HP Frame 445T RPM 1775 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 1,692.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

50. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,692.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 125 HP Frame 404TCZ RPM 3565 ENCL DP Voltage PRICE 1,212.00 NO BID 1,709.40 NO BID

51. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,212.00  1,709.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 125 HP Frame 405TP20 RPM 1770 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 3,939.00 NO BID 6,244.00 NO BID

52. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 3,939.00  6,244.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 444TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 1,692.00 NO BID 2,048.20 NO BID

53. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,692.00  2,048.20  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 405TS RPM 3560 ENCL ODP Voltage PRICE 1,212.00 NO BID 2,048.20 NO BID

54. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,212.00  2,048.20  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 449T RPM 1188 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 2,009.00 NO BID 7,238.00 NO BID

55. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 2,009.00  7,238.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 444TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 4,639.00 NO BID 7,238.00 NO BID

56. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 4,639.00  7,238.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 405TS RPM 3560 ENCL ODP Voltage PRICE 3,874.00 NO BID 7,962.00 NO BID

57. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 3,874.00  7,962.00  

3



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 16-8073

 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 449T RPM 1188 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 5,240.00 NO BID 7,238.00 NO BID

58. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 5,240.00  7,238.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 444TPA RPM 1775 ENCL RU Voltage PRICE 4,639.00 NO BID 7,238.00 NO BID

59. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 4,639.00  7,238.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 444TPT RPM 1775 ENCL RU Voltage PRICE 4,639.00 NO BID 7,238.00 NO BID

60. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 4,639.00  7,238.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 449VP RPM 890 ENCL TE Voltage 230/460 PRICE 6,525.00 NO BID 8,794.00 NO BID

61. Rewind TOTAL 6,525.00  8,794.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 445TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 4,639.00 NO BID 7,238.00 NO BID

62. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 4,639.00  7,238.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 150 HP Frame 444TPA RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 4,639.00 NO BID 7,238.00 NO BID

63. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 4,639.00  7,238.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 445TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 1,692.00 NO BID 2,402.40 NO BID

64. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,692.00  2,402.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 5810S RPM 1190 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 2,833.00 NO BID 2,402.40 NO BID

65. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 2,833.00  2,402.40  

 1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 5006 RPM 1785 ENCL WP1 Voltage 230/460 PRICE 2,833.00 NO BID 2,402.40 NO BID

66. Recondition TOTAL 2,833.00  2,402.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 6326Y RPM 1800 ENCL DP Voltage 230/460 PRICE 2,833.00 NO BID 2,402.40 NO BID

67. Recondition TOTAL 2,833.00  2,402.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 445TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 5,680.00 NO BID 9,134.00 NO BID

68. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 5,680.00  9,134.00  

 1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 5810S RPM 1190 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 6,593.00 NO BID 10,766.00 NO BID

69. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 6,593.00  10,766.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 5006 RPM 1785 ENCL WP1 Voltage 230/460 PRICE 6,593.00 NO BID 9,134.00 NO BID

70. Rewind TOTAL 6,593.00  9,134.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 6326Y RPM 1800 ENCL DP Voltage 230/460 PRICE 4,995.00 NO BID 9,134.00 NO BID

71. Rewind TOTAL 4,995.00  9,134.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 449TZ RPM 1780 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 5,413.00 NO BID 9,134.00 NO BID

72. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 5,413.00  9,134.00  

 1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 445TP RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 5,680.00 NO BID 9,134.00 NO BID

73 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 5,680.00  9,134.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 5008P RPM 1190 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 6,593.00 NO BID 10,766.00 NO BID

74. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 6,593.00  10,766.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 200 HP Frame 5009S RPM 1185 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 5,684.00 NO BID 10,766.00 NO BID

75. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 5,684.00  10,766.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 250 HP Frame 445TPA RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 1,692.00 NO BID 2,402.40 NO BID

76. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,692.00  2,402.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 250 HP Frame 445T RPM 1780 ENCL DP Voltage PRICE 1,521.00 NO BID 2,402.40 NO BID

77. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 1,521.00  2,402.40  
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
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1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 250 HP Frame 5008PH RPM 1780 ENCL DP Voltage PRICE 2,550.00 NO BID 2,402.40 NO BID

78. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 2,550.00  2,402.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 250 HP Frame 5007 RPM 1779 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 2,833.00 NO BID 2,402.40 NO BID

79. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 2,833.00  2,402.40  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 250 HP Frame 445TPA RPM 1775 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 6,672.00 NO BID 10,942.00 NO BID

80. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 6,672.00  10,942.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 250 HP Frame 445T RPM 1780 ENCL DP Voltage 230/460 PRICE 5,286.00 NO BID 10,942.00 NO BID

81. Rewind TOTAL 5,286.00  10,942.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 250 HP Frame 5008PH RPM 1780 ENCL DP Voltage PRICE 7,144.00 NO BID 10,942.00 NO BID

82. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 7,144.00  10,942.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 250 HP Frame 5007 RPM 1779 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 5,758.00 NO BID 10,942.00 NO BID

83. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 5,758.00  10,942.00  

 NO BID

SUB TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 217,568.50 NO BID 352,736.20  

GROUP 1 PURCHASE OR MANUFACTURED PARTS

 NO BID

a. Estimated Annual Purchases $50,000 50,000.00 NO BID 50,000.00  

20%  25-30% NO BID

b. Add Cost Plus Mark Up % 10,000.00 NO BID 16,666.66  

 NO BID

c. Total (a+b) TOTAL 60,000.00 NO BID 66,666.66  

 NO BID

Sub Total for Group 1 60,000.00 NO BID 66,666.66  

GROUP 1 SERVICE PRICE/

800 hrs. HOUR 30.00  88.00 NO BID

1. In Shop Repair Labor TOTAL 24,000.00 NO BID 70,400.00  

PRICE/

200 hrs. HOUR 30.00  88.00 NO BID

2. Field Service Labor TOTAL 6,000.00 NO BID 17,600.00  

PRICE/

200 hrs. HOUR 30.00  88.00 NO BID

3. Machine Shop Labor TOTAL 6,000.00 NO BID 17,600.00  

 NO BID

Sub Total for Group 1 36,000.00 NO BID 105,600.00  

GROUP 1 EMERGENCY SERVICE PRICE/

200 hrs. HOUR 40.00  105.00 NO BID

1. Emergency Service (5 days or less) TOTAL 8,000.00 NO BID 21,000.00  

 NO BID

Sub Total for Group 1 8,000.00 NO BID 21,000.00  

GROUP 1 TEAR DOWN AND INSPECTION REPORT UNIT

40 ea. PRICE  88.00 NO BID

1. Tear Down and Inspection Report (Small Electric Motors) TOTAL 0.00 NO BID 3,520.00  

 NO BID

Sub Total for Group 1 TOTAL 0.00 NO BID 3,520.00  
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
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GROUP 1 REPLACEMENT MOTOR SMALL ELECTRIC MOTORS

Cost Plus applies to all Purchased Replacement Motors    NO BID

a. Estimated Annual Purchases $50,000 50,000.00 NO BID 50,000.00  

20%  20% NO BID

b. Add Cost Plus Mark Up % 10,000.00 NO BID 10,000.00  

 NO BID

c. Total (a+b) TOTAL 60,000.00 NO BID 60,000.00  

*  

 NO BID

TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 381,568.50 NO BID 609,522.86  

GROUP 2 LARGE MOTOR (GREATER THAN 250 HP) AND INCLUDES 

REWINDING, RECONDITIONING, MACHINE-WORK, AND TEAR

DOWN, INSPECT AND REPAIR

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 300 HP Frame 5008VPH RPM 1180 ENCL WP11 Voltage  PRICE 2,833.00 1,927.00 4,276.00 NO BID

1. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 2,833.00 1,927.00 4,276.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 300 HP Frame 449T RPM 1788 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 2,009.00 1,927.00 2,112.00 NO BID

2. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 2,009.00 1,927.00 2,112.00  

 1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 300 HP Frame 5008P RPM 1785 ENCL WP1 Voltage 4160 PRICE 2,833.00 3,724.00 3,960.00 NO BID

3. Recondition TOTAL 2,833.00 3,724.00 3,960.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 300 HP Frame 5008VPH RPM 1180 ENCL WP11 Voltage PRICE 9,246.00 7,060.00 14,768.00 NO BID

4. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 9,246.00 7,060.00 14,768.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 300 HP Frame 449T RPM 1788 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 7,309.00 6,273.00 12,876.00 NO BID

5. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 7,309.00 6,273.00 12,876.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 350 HP Frame 447TPA RPM 1785 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 2,009.00 1,286.00 4,276.00 NO BID

6. 230/460 Recondition TOTAL 2,009.00 1,286.00 4,276.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 350 HP Frame 447TPA RPM 1785 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 8,690.00 6,763.00 14,768.00 NO BID

7. 230/460 Rewind TOTAL 8,690.00 6,763.00 14,768.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 5809 PH RPM 1185 ENCL WP11 Voltage PRICE 7,179.00 4,715.00 9,960.00 NO BID

8. 4160 Recondition TOTAL 7,179.00 4,715.00 9,960.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 5807S RPM 1190 ENCL WP1 Voltage 4160 PRICE 6,344.00 6,148.00 6,659.00 NO BID

9. Recondition TOTAL 6,344.00 6,148.00 6,659.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 5808B RPM 1185 ENCL WP1 Voltage 4160 PRICE 6,344.00 6,148.00 6,659.00 NO BID

10. Recondition TOTAL 6,344.00 6,148.00 6,659.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 5009S RPM 1781 ENCL WP1 Voltage 4160 PRICE 5,090.00 5,616.00 6,719.00 NO BID

11. Recondition TOTAL 5,090.00 5,616.00 6,719.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 501OUS RPM 1185 ENCL TEFC Voltage PRICE 6,970.00 6,148.00 6,850.00 NO BID

12. 4160 Recondition TOTAL 6,970.00 6,148.00 6,850.00  

2 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 5809 PH RPM 1185 ENCL WP11 Voltage PRICE 18,868.00 15,259.00 27,086.00 NO BID

13. 4160 Rewind TOTAL 37,736.00 30,518.00 54,172.00  

2 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 5807S RPM 1190 ENCL WP1 Voltage 4160 PRICE 16,085.00 16,252.00 23,553.00 NO BID

14. Rewind TOTAL 32,170.00 32,504.00 47,106.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 5808B RPM 1185 ENCL WP1 Voltage 4160 PRICE 16,085.00 16,252.00 23,553.00 NO BID

15. Rewind TOTAL 16,085.00 16,252.00 23,553.00  
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
an

 A
n

to
n

io
 A

rm
at

u
re

 W
o

rk
s,

 I
n

c.

1
0

1
5

 N
. 
C

o
lo

ra
d

o

S
an

 A
n

to
n

io
, 
T

X
 7

8
2

0
7

E
v

an
s 

E
n

te
rp

ri
se

s,
 I

n
c.

2
0

1
 S

. 
In

d
u

st
ri

al
 D

r.

W
ac

o
, 
T

X
 7

6
7

1
0

In
te

g
ra

te
d

 P
o

w
er

 S
er

v
ic

es

1
5

0
0

 E
. 
M

ai
n

 S
t.

L
a 

P
o

rt
e,

 T
X

 

L
o

n
es

ta
r 

A
rm

at
u

re

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 5009S RPM 1781 ENCL WP1 Voltage 4160 PRICE 13,634.00 14,479.00 20,813.00 NO BID

16. Rewind TOTAL 13,634.00 14,479.00 20,813.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 400 HP Frame 501OUS RPM 1185 ENCL TEFC Voltage  PRICE 15,465.00 16,252.00 24,600.00 NO BID

17. 4160 Rewind TOTAL 15,465.00 16,252.00 24,600.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 450 HP 5008P Frame 1775 RPM  ENCL DP Voltage 460 PRICE 6,107.00 2,157.00 7,383.00 NO BID

18. Recondition TOTAL 6,107.00 2,157.00 7,383.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 450 HP 5008P Frame 1775 RPM  ENCL DP Voltage 460 PRICE 17,023.00 7,167.00 25,432.00 NO BID

19. Rewind TOTAL 17,023.00 7,167.00 25,432.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 500 HP Frame 400CB RPM 1191 ENCL TEFC Voltage 4160 PRICE 7,567.00 6,686.00 6,675.00 NO BID

20. Recondition TOTAL 7,567.00 6,686.00 6,675.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 500 HP Frame 400CB RPM 1191 ENCL TEFC Voltage 4160 PRICE 20,161.00 18,045.00 27,457.00 NO BID

21. Rewind TOTAL 20,161.00 18,045.00 27,457.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 600 HP Frame 6811S RPM 1190 ENCL TEFC Voltage 4160 PRICE 8,654.00 7,135.00 11,431.00 NO BID

22. Recondition TOTAL 8,654.00 7,135.00 11,431.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 600 HP Frame 5012S RPM 1790 ENCL TE Voltage 4160 PRICE 7,858.00 6,483.00 10,431.00 NO BID

23. Recondition TOTAL 7,858.00 6,483.00 10,431.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 600 HP Frame 6811S RPM 1190 ENCL TEFC Voltage 4160 PRICE 23,785.00 19,543.00 29,881.00 NO BID

24. Rewind TOTAL 23,785.00 19,543.00 29,881.00  

 1 ea. UNIT

 Three-Phase, 600 HP Frame 5012S RPM 1790 ENCL TE Voltage 4160 PRICE 21,134.00 17,368.00 26,349.00 NO BID

25. Rewind TOTAL 21,134.00 17,368.00 26,349.00  

 1 ea. UNIT

 Three-Phase, 700 HP Frame 6808PZ RPM 885 ENCL WP11 Voltage 4160 PRICE 10,588.00 7,318.00 14,277.00 NO BID

26. Recondition TOTAL 10,588.00 7,318.00 14,277.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 700 HP Frame 6808PZ RPM 885 ENCL WP11 Voltage 4160 PRICE 29,062.00 23,499.00 14,277.00 NO BID

27. Rewind TOTAL 29,062.00 23,499.00 14,277.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 700 HP Frame 6809S RPM 1185 ENCL TE Voltage 4160 PRICE 25,755.00 21,856.00 32,769.00 NO BID

28. Rewind TOTAL 25,755.00 21,856.00 32,769.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 900 HP Frame 5810PH RPM 1175 ENCL WP1 Voltage 460  PRICE 11,093.00 6,402.00 13,260.00 NO BID

29. Recondition TOTAL 11,093.00 6,402.00 13,260.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 900 HP Frame 5810PH RPM 1175 ENCL WP1 Voltage 460  PRICE 31,917.00 20,372.00 33,829.00 NO BID

30. Rewind TOTAL 31,917.00 20,372.00 33,829.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 1000 HP Frame 6808PA RPM 1785 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 10,692.00 7,367.00 13,620.00 NO BID

31. 4160   Recondition TOTAL 10,692.00 7,367.00 13,620.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 1000 HP Frame V2689 RPM 1800 ENCL DP Voltage 4160   PRICE 10,692.00 7,641.00 13,620.00 NO BID

32. Recondition TOTAL 10,692.00 7,641.00 13,620.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 1000 HP Frame 6808PA RPM 1790 ENCL WP11 Voltage PRICE 10,692.00 7,367.00 14,858.00 NO BID

33. 4160   Recondition TOTAL 10,692.00 7,367.00 14,858.00  
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
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1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 1000 HP Frame 6808PA RPM 1785 ENCL WP1 Voltage PRICE 30,579.00 23,674.00 39,838.00 NO BID

34. 4160   Rewind TOTAL 30,579.00 23,674.00 39,838.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 1000 HP Frame V2689 RPM 1800 ENCL DP Voltage 4160 PRICE 30,579.00 21,231.00 37,791.00 NO BID

35. Rewind TOTAL 30,579.00 21,231.00 37,791.00  

1 ea. UNIT

Three-Phase, 1000 HP Frame 6808PA RPM 1790 ENCL WP11 Voltage PRICE 30,579.00 23,674.00 39,838.00 NO BID

36. 4160   Rewind TOTAL 30,579.00 23,674.00 39,838.00  

 

NO BID

 Sub Total Group 2 TOTAL 526,463.00 422,725.00 677,143.00  

GROUP 2 PURCHASE OR MANUFACTURED PARTS

NO BID

a. Estimated Annual Purchases $100,000 100,000.00 100,000.00 100,000.00  

20% 19% 25% NO BID

b. Add Cost Plus Mark Up % 20,000.00 19,000.00 25,000.00  

NO BID

c. Total (a+b) 120,000.00 119,000.00 125,000.00  

NO BID

Sub Total for Group 2 TOTAL 120,000.00 119,000.00 125,000.00  

GROUP 2 SERVICE PRICE/

HOUR 30.00 45.00 120.00 NO BID

1. In Shop Repair Labor TOTAL 24,000.00 36,000.00 96,000.00  

PRICE/

HOUR 30.00 45.00 90.00 NO BID

2. Field Service Labor TOTAL 6,000.00 9,000.00 18,000.00  

PRICE/

HOUR 30.00 45.00 120.00 NO BID

3. Machine Shop Labor TOTAL 6,000.00 9,000.00 24,000.00  

NO BID

Sub Total for Group 2 36,000.00 54,000.00 138,000.00  

GROUP 2 EMERGENCY SERVICE PRICE/

HOUR 40.00 45.00 142.00 NO BID

1. Emergency Service (5 days or less) TOTAL 8,000.00 9,000.00 28,400.00  

NO BID

Sub Total for Group 2 8,000.00 9,000.00 28,400.00  

GROUP 2 TEAR DOWN AND INSPECTION REPORT UNIT

PRICE 120.00 NO BID

1. Tear Down and Inspection Report (Small Electric Motors) TOTAL 0.00 0.00 4,800.00  

*

NO BID

GRAND TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 690,463.00 604,725.00 968,543.00  

TOTAL GROUP 2 NO BID

 GRAND TOTAL FOR GROUPS 1 & 2 TOTAL 1,072,031.50 604,725.00 1,578,065.86  

EXTENSION 1 381,568.50 604,725.00

EXTENSION 2 381,568.50 604,725.00

EXTENSION 3 381,568.50 604,725.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair 

FOR: Small Motors (10-250 HP) and Large Motors (Greater than 250 HP)

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2015)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 28, 2016
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Net Net 1%

Terms  30 days 30 days 10 days

Delivery Days

*LOW BIDDER  

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Amerimex Demandstar
Austin Armature Works SAWS Website

Capital Electric Motor Service

Clifford Power

DNR Electric

EMR

Evans Enterprises, Inc.

Hamilton Electric

Integrated Power Services

Lonestar Armature

 Massengale Armature Works

Mikes Electric Motors

Paramount Electric Motors

San Antonio Armature Works

Smith Pump 

9


